
YEAR 1 -  2024 COHORT

IME PHASE 2 PROGRAM  
2024/25 



2024      
Wed 10 July         IME2 Induction Day: Curate and TI
                               St Boniface Church*, 9.30 am - 3.30 pm
  
Wed 11 Sept         Growing, Learning & Thriving in Curacy 
                                St Boniface Church, 9.30 am - 3.00 pm

Wed 9 Oct            Being a Deacon 
                               St Boniface Church, 9.30 am -  3.00 pm

Tues 15 Oct          Welcome Tour, Tea and Evensong
                               Winchester Cathedral, 2.45 - 6.15 pm

Wed 13 Nov          Thriving in Curacy & beyond
                                 Zoom: 7.00 - 9.00 pm

 Thurs 28 Nov        Baptisms & Funerals 
                                 Zoom 7.00 - 9.00 pm

Thurs 5 Dec            Writing a reflection 
                                 Zoom: 7.00—8.00 pm

*St Boniface Church, Hursley Road,  Chandler’s Ford, SO53 2FT.  
Parking is available. 



2025     
 21-22 Jan        Working Together Residential 
                          Curates and Training Incumbents    
                          Sarum College, Salisbury

Wed 12 Feb     Accessible Church?
                           St Boniface Church, 9.30 - 3.00 pm

Wed 12 Mar     Knowing Your Community
                            St Boniface Church, 9.30 am - 3.00 pm

Wed 9 April       Diversity and Prejudice
                            Zoom, 7.00 - 9.00 pm

 Tues 20 May    Preparing for Priesthood 
                            Winchester Cathedral 

                           9.30 am - 3.00 pm 

 
Thurs 5 June      Growing Faith
                             Led by the Diocesan Education Team
                             St Boniface Church, 9.30 am - 3.00 pm

 

When we meet on site at St Boniface, refreshments will be
available from 9:15am. Please provide your own lunch. 

Fri 7 Feb          First Reflection due: Call to Ministry 

Fri 23 May          Second Reflection due: Wisdom



Over the next four years we will gather together either on site or
online to learn together and reflect on key aspects of ministry.
The majority of the learning you do will be in your benefice
context; learning with and from your training incumbent, other
colleagues and members of the churches and communities you
serve in.  

The IME2 training program is designed to complement the
contextual development and learning you will be doing in your
benefice. It will provide additional aspects of input on relevant
topics as well as ensuring space is available to talk and process
together as a cohort. Some of the program will be formal in feel
and style and other aspects will much more informal. 

After ordination, at your induction day, you will be given an IME2
Handbook containing detailed information about the whole of
your curacy. You will also be enrolled into our Moodle platform,
which gives you continued access to the 'Hub Resources'.  This is  
the place we share resources relating to our training and the
more general aspects of your curacy. Moodle will also be where
you submit written reflections on the formation qualities. 
 

If you have any queries about your training, or there are any
areas where you think we can provide support, please contact:

Chris Hill, IME2 and CMD Officer 
chris.hill@winchester.anglican.org

Frances Ter Haar, Administrator
frances.terhaar@winchester.anglican.org

 


